MANIPUR ggmg GAZETTE

m .

TR AR

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 429 Imphal, Friday, March 6, 2020 (Phalguna 16, 1941)

GOVERNMENT OF MANIPUR
SECRETARIAT: LAW & LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION
Imphal, the 6th March, 2020

No. 2/2/2020-Leg/L : The following Act of the Legislature, Manipur which received assent
of the Governor of Manipur on March 5, 2020 is hereby published in the Official Gazette:

THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTERS (MANIPUR)
(THIRTEENTH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2020

(MANIPUR ACT NO. 5 OF 2020)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Salaries and Allowances of the Ministers
(Manipur) Act, 1972.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Manipur in the Seventy-
first Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Salaries and Allowances Short titie and
of Ministers (Manipur) (Thirteenth Amendment) Act, 2020  ©™7™em"t

(2) Tt shall come into force from the date of its
publication in the Official Gazette. '

2. In section 3 of the Salaries and Allowances of Amn_mdmem of
Ministers (Manipur) Act, 1972 (hereinafter referred to as the section 3.
Principal Act), the following shall be substituted, namely,-

(a) in sub-section (1)-

(i} in clause (a), for the words and figures
“Rs. 26,000/-", the words and figures
*“Rs. 75.000/-” shall be substituted:



2

(i1) in clause (b), for the words and figures
“Rs. 25,000/-", the words and figures
“Rs.70.000/-" shall be substituted;

(ili)in clause (c). for the words and’ figures
“Rs. 25,000/-", the words and figures
“Rs. 70,000/- shall be substituted; and

(iv) in clause (d), for the words and figures
“Rs. 24,000/-", the words and figures
“Rs. 65,000/ shall be substituted.

{b) in sub-section (2)-

(i) in clause (a), for the words and figures
“Rs. 2,000/-" and “Rs. 3,000/-", the words and
figures *“Rs. 5,000/-" and *“Rs. 6,000/-"
respectively shall be substituted;

(ii) in clause (b), for the words and figures
“Rs. 1,950/ and “Rs. 2,900/-", the words and
figures “Rs. 4,500/ and “Rs. 5,000/-"
respectively shall be substituted;

(ili)in clause (c), for the words and figures
“Rs. 1,930/-" and “Rs. 2,800/-", the words and
figures “Rs, 4,000/-" and *“Rs. 4,500/-"
respectively shall be substituted.

ANM:;:: :f 3. In section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words and
" figures “Rs. 24,000/-", “Rs. 23,500/-" and  “Rs. 23,100/-",
the words and figures “Rs. 65,000/-", “Rs. 60,000/-" and

“Rs. 55,000/-" respectively shall be substituted.

Amendmentof 4, Jn section 9 of the Principal Act. for the words “Rupees
section 9.

fifteen lakhs”, the words “Rupees thinty lakhs™ shall be
substituted.

NUNGSHITOMBI ATHOKPAM,
Secretary (Law),
Government of Manipur

Printed at the Directorate of Printing & Stationery, Government of Manipur/255-C/6-03-2020.



